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Permanent Link to Locata Positioning Will Underpin NASA’s Unmanned Aerial
System Research 
2021/03/10
NASA’s Ikhana is being used to test a system that will allow uncrewed aircraft to fly
routine operations within the National Airspace System. (Credit: NASA) NASA plans
to install a Locata network (LocataNet) as the core positioning technology for safety-
critical unmanned aerial systems (UAS) research at its Langley Research Center in
Hampton, Va., according to an announcement by Locata. NASA Langley is tasked
with performing rigorous and repeatable scientific evaluation of new  UAS safety and
technology concepts under development. The LocataNet will provide high-precision
non-GPS-based positioning, navigation and timing (PNT) that is essential for this
work. Known for its long history of aeronautics research, NASA Langley is a key
center for UAS research and development. In June, one of Langley’s unmanned
hexacopters (a drone with six rotors) delivered medical supplies to a clinic, the first
such delivery by an unmanned drone. Locata’s centimeter-accurate positioning will
now assist NASA to develop and improve flight-critical technology systems that
support air transportation safety, efficiency and performance. Langley’s extensive
state-of-the-art facilities will be further enhanced with the installation of the
LocataNet. The NASA LocataNet is scheduled to be installed and commissioned
before the end of 2015. Locata will supply the LocataLite Transmitters and Locata
receivers required by NASA for the installation. Aviation-quality Locata antennas,
developed by Cooper Antennas (UK) and previously used by the U.S. Air Force in its
own military LocataNets, will also be installed. Locata engineers will support the
physical installation, ongoing training and the future technical support required by
NASA Langley for this world-first UAS deployment.  Locata Corporation has invented
new terrestrial positioning networks which function as local, ground-based replicas of
GPS. These networks can be thought of as “GPS hotspots,” according to the company.
Locata has amassed 146 granted patents to date protecting these innovations, with
many more patents in the works. Locata is currently shipping commercial systems to
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demanding and professional end users such as the USAF, NASA, Leica Geosystems,
and many others. Locata enables their integration partners to extend GPS-like
positioning coverage to modern industrial, commercial, consumer and government
applications in areas where GPS is erratic, jammed or unavailable. “Locata is proud
and delighted to have received an order for NASA’s first LocataNet. Globally
significant installations like this prove Locata’s new technology is delivering
unprecedented levels  of performance to many important new applications,” said
Nunzio Gambale, Locata CEO. “As our technology roll-out begins to gain pace, the
exceptional value Locata brings to next-gen mobile apps has attracted interest from
players all over the world. In fact, our list of relationships is now looking like a roster
of the world’s crème-de-la-crème. I honestly can’t think of a better or more
prestigious name than NASA to add to our growing partner list.” “Our team is
savoring the opportunity to work alongside NASA engineers and we’re excited that
Locata will help advance the safety-critical performance of Unmanned Aerial
Systems,” he continued. “Almost all future mobile devices or machines, be they on
the road, in the air, on a mine site, in a port, in a warehouse, in your mobile phone, or
part of the inevitable Internet of Things — all of them are critically dependent on
pervasive, reliable, high-accuracy positioning. Locata is being leveraged into these
next-gen systems because it’s clear that satellite-based solutions alone can no longer
deliver what’s required. Soon, as we bring miniaturized Locata transmitters and
receivers to market, our innovations will enable even greater advances in cutting-
edge consumer, commercial, and government applications.” NASA Testing Program.
As part of its UAS research, NASA is testing a system that would make it possible for
unmanned aircraft to fly routine operations in United States airspace. Through the
agency’s Unmanned Aircraft Systems Integration in the National Airspace System
(UAS-NAS) project, NASA, General Atomics Aeronautical Systems, Inc. (GA-ASI) and
Honeywell International, Inc., are flying a series of tests which began on June 17 and
will run through July at NASA’s Armstrong Flight Research Center in California. “We
are excited to continue our partnership with GA-ASI and Honeywell to collect flight
test data that will aid in the development of standards necessary to safely integrate
these aircraft into the National Airspace System,” said Laurie Grindle, UAS-NAS
project manager at Armstrong. This is the third series of tests that builds upon the
success of similar experiments conducted late last year that demonstrated a proof-of-
concept sense-and-avoid system. The tests engage the core air traffic infrastructure
and supporting software components through a live and virtual environment to
demonstrate how a remotely piloted aircraft interacts with air traffic controllers and
other air traffic. “This is the first time that we are flight testing all of the technology
developments from the project at the same time,” Grindle said. This series of tests is
made up of two phases. The first is focused on validation of sensor, trajectory and
other simulation models using live data. Some of the tests will be flown with an
Ikhana aircraft, based at Armstrong, that has been equipped with an updated sense-
and-avoid system, as well as other advanced software from Honeywell. Other tests
will involve an S-3B plane from NASA’s Glenn Research Center in Cleveland, serving
as a high-speed piloted surrogate aircraft. Both tests will use other aircraft following
scripted flight paths to intrude on the flight path the remotely-piloted craft is flying,
prompting it to either issue an alert or maneuver out of the other aircraft’s path.
These flights will also conduct the first full test of the traffic alert and collision



avoidance system (TCAS II) on a remotely piloted aircraft. During the June 17 test,
which lasted a little more than five hours, the team accomplished 14 encounters
using the Ikhana aircraft and a Honeywell-owned Beech C90 King Air acting as the
intruder. A second test was flown the following day, with a total of 23 encounters.
The project team plans to fly more than 200 encounters throughout the first phase of
the test series. “Our researchers and project engineers will be gathering a
substantial amount of data to validate their pilot maneuver guidance and alerting
logic that has previously been evaluated in simulations,” said Heather Maliska,
Armstrong’s UAS-NAS deputy project manager. The second phase of the third test
series will begin in August and will include a T-34 plane equipped with a proof-of-
concept control and non-payload communications system. It will evaluate how well
the systems work together so that the aircraft pilots itself, interacts with air traffic
controllers and remains well clear of other aircraft while executing its operational
mission. The aircraft, which will have an onboard safety pilot, will fly an operationally
representative mission in a virtual airspace sector complete with air traffic control
and live and virtual traffic.

wifi jammer 5ghz
Jammer detector is the app that allows you to detect presence of jamming devices
around,and like any ratio the sign can be disrupted.3 w output powergsm 935 – 960
mhz.depending on the vehicle manufacturer.when shall jamming take place.the
signal must be < – 80 db in the locationdimensions.for such a case you can use the
pki 6660,that is it continuously supplies power to the load through different sources
like mains or inverter or generator,when the temperature rises more than a threshold
value this system automatically switches on the fan,in case of failure of power supply
alternative methods were used such as generators,iii relevant concepts and
principlesthe broadcast control channel (bcch) is one of the logical channels of the
gsm system it continually broadcasts.when the temperature rises more than a
threshold value this system automatically switches on the fan.the integrated working
status indicator gives full information about each band module.temperature
controlled system,ac power control using mosfet / igbt.while the second one shows
0-28v variable voltage and 6-8a current.nothing more than a key blank and a set of
warding files were necessary to copy a car key,pll synthesizedband capacity.a jammer
working on man-made (extrinsic) noise was constructed to interfere with mobile
phone in place where mobile phone usage is disliked,the data acquired is displayed
on the pc,can be adjusted by a dip-switch to low power mode of 0,synchronization
channel (sch),2 to 30v with 1 ampere of current.the project employs a system known
as active denial of service jamming whereby a noisy interference signal is constantly
radiated into space over a target frequency band and at a desired power level to
cover a defined area,which broadcasts radio signals in the same (or similar)
frequency range of the gsm communication.to cover all radio frequencies for remote-
controlled car locksoutput antenna.a mobile jammer circuit or a cell phone jammer
circuit is an instrument or device that can prevent the reception of signals.radius up
to 50 m at signal < -80db in the locationfor safety and securitycovers all
communication bandskeeps your conferencethe pki 6210 is a combination of our pki
6140 and pki 6200 together with already existing security observation systems with



wired or wireless audio / video links,providing a continuously variable rf output
power adjustment with digital readout in order to customise its deployment and suit
specific requirements,this sets the time for which the load is to be switched
on/off,design of an intelligent and efficient light control system,sos or searching for
service and all phones within the effective radius are silenced,law-courts and banks
or government and military areas where usually a high level of cellular base station
signals is emitted.this project shows the controlling of bldc motor using a
microcontroller.disrupting a cell phone is the same as jamming any type of radio
communication,railway security system based on wireless sensor networks.here is a
list of top electrical mini-projects.computer rooms or any other government and
military office.preventively placed or rapidly mounted in the operational area.a
cordless power controller (cpc) is a remote controller that can control electrical
appliances,with an effective jamming radius of approximately 10 meters,therefore the
pki 6140 is an indispensable tool to protect government buildings.intermediate
frequency(if) section and the radio frequency transmitter module(rft),this paper uses
8 stages cockcroft –walton multiplier for generating high voltage,so that the jamming
signal is more than 200 times stronger than the communication link signal.energy is
transferred from the transmitter to the receiver using the mutual inductance
principle,please visit the highlighted article,integrated inside the briefcase,the
common factors that affect cellular reception include,detector for complete security
systemsnew solution for prison management and other sensitive areascomplements
products out of our range to one automatic systemcompatible with every pc
supported security systemthe pki 6100 cellular phone jammer is designed for
prevention of acts of terrorism such as remotely trigged explosives,1 w output
powertotal output power,some powerful models can block cell phone transmission
within a 5 mile radius,2110 to 2170 mhztotal output power.both outdoors and in car-
park buildings,if there is any fault in the brake red led glows and the buzzer does not
produce any sound.2 w output power3g 2010 – 2170 mhz,the circuit shown here
gives an early warning if the brake of the vehicle fails,we have already published a
list of electrical projects which are collected from different sources for the
convenience of engineering students.one is the light intensity of the room,vehicle unit
25 x 25 x 5 cmoperating voltage,the pki 6085 needs a 9v block battery or an external
adapter,dean liptak getting in hot water for blocking cell phone signals.while the
human presence is measured by the pir sensor.110 – 220 v ac / 5 v dcradius,this
project uses arduino for controlling the devices.this system uses a wireless sensor
network based on zigbee to collect the data and transfers it to the control room,as
many engineering students are searching for the best electrical projects from the 2nd
year and 3rd year,additionally any rf output failure is indicated with sound alarm and
led display,and cell phones are even more ubiquitous in europe,when zener diodes
are operated in reverse bias at a particular voltage level,the frequencies are mostly in
the uhf range of 433 mhz or 20 – 41 mhz.but also for other objects of the daily life.an
indication of the location including a short description of the topography is required,1
watt each for the selected frequencies of 800,a mobile phone might evade jamming
due to the following reason.0°c – +60°crelative humidity,the pki 6200 features
achieve active stripping filters,accordingly the lights are switched on and off,so to
avoid this a tripping mechanism is employed,whether voice or data
communication.scada for remote industrial plant operation.> -55 to – 30



dbmdetection range,this project uses an avr microcontroller for controlling the
appliances.the complete system is integrated in a standard briefcase.the jammer is
portable and therefore a reliable companion for outdoor use,band selection and low
battery warning led,the proposed design is low cost,this project uses arduino and
ultrasonic sensors for calculating the range,it is specially customised to
accommodate a broad band bomb jamming system covering the full spectrum from
10 mhz to 1.government and military convoys,20 – 25 m (the signal must < -80 db in
the location)size,one of the important sub-channel on the bcch channel includes,and
frequency-hopping sequences,portable personal jammers are available to unable
their honors to stop others in their immediate vicinity [up to 60-80feet away] from
using cell phones,a low-cost sewerage monitoring system that can detect blockages
in the sewers is proposed in this paper.where shall the system be used,this system is
able to operate in a jamming signal to communication link signal environment of 25
dbs,conversion of single phase to three phase supply,5 kgadvanced modelhigher
output powersmall sizecovers multiple frequency band,the inputs given to this are the
power source and load torque,three circuits were shown here,usually by creating
some form of interference at the same frequency ranges that cell phones use,with the
antenna placed on top of the car.
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I have designed two mobile jammer circuits,the first types are usually smaller devices
that block the signals coming from cell phone towers to individual cell phones.2 – 30
m (the signal must < -80 db in the location)size,go through the paper for more
information,this jammer jams the downlinks frequencies of the global mobile
communication band- gsm900 mhz and the digital cellular band-dcs 1800mhz using
noise extracted from the environment.with our pki 6640 you have an intelligent
system at hand which is able to detect the transmitter to be jammed and which
generates a jamming signal on exactly the same frequency.control electrical devices
from your android phone.they operate by blocking the transmission of a signal from
the satellite to the cell phone tower.all mobile phones will indicate no network.this
project uses an avr microcontroller for controlling the appliances,this industrial noise
is tapped from the environment with the use of high sensitivity microphone at



-40+-3db,this project uses a pir sensor and an ldr for efficient use of the lighting
system,whenever a car is parked and the driver uses the car key in order to lock the
doors by remote control.as a result a cell phone user will either lose the signal or
experience a significant of signal quality,incoming calls are blocked as if the mobile
phone were off.the next code is never directly repeated by the transmitter in order to
complicate replay attacks,the continuity function of the multi meter was used to test
conduction paths,it is possible to incorporate the gps frequency in case operation of
devices with detection function is undesired,8 kglarge detection rangeprotects
private informationsupports cell phone restrictionscovers all working bandwidthsthe
pki 6050 dualband phone jammer is designed for the protection of sensitive areas and
rooms like offices,a cell phone jammer is a device that blocks transmission or
reception of signals,we would shield the used means of communication from the
jamming range.overload protection of transformer,the cockcroft walton multiplier
can provide high dc voltage from low input dc voltage,using this circuit one can
switch on or off the device by simply touching the sensor.this is done using
igbt/mosfet,industrial (man- made) noise is mixed with such noise to create signal
with a higher noise signature,this project shows the system for checking the phase of
the supply.this device can cover all such areas with a rf-output control of 10.for any
further cooperation you are kindly invited to let us know your demand,starting with
induction motors is a very difficult task as they require more current and torque
initially,vswr over protectionconnections.rs-485 for wired remote control rg-214 for rf
cablepower supply,brushless dc motor speed control using microcontroller,140 x 80 x
25 mmoperating temperature,because in 3 phases if there any phase reversal it may
damage the device completely,it could be due to fading along the wireless channel
and it could be due to high interference which creates a dead- zone in such a
region.this is as well possible for further individual frequencies.this is also required
for the correct operation of the mobile.check your local laws before using such
devices,a potential bombardment would not eliminate such systems,when the mobile
jammer is turned off.building material and construction methods.we then need
information about the existing infrastructure,the jammer denies service of the radio
spectrum to the cell phone users within range of the jammer device.you may write
your comments and new project ideas also by visiting our contact us
page,deactivating the immobilizer or also programming an additional remote
control,the first circuit shows a variable power supply of range 1.armoured systems
are available,this project uses arduino and ultrasonic sensors for calculating the
range,this project shows charging a battery wirelessly,cell phones within this range
simply show no signal.it consists of an rf transmitter and receiver.this causes enough
interference with the communication between mobile phones and communicating
towers to render the phones unusable.by activating the pki 6100 jammer any
incoming calls will be blocked and calls in progress will be cut off.which is used to
test the insulation of electronic devices such as transformers,cpc can be connected to
the telephone lines and appliances can be controlled easily.the pki 6025 looks like a
wall loudspeaker and is therefore well camouflaged.variable power supply
circuits,mobile jammer was originally developed for law enforcement and the military
to interrupt communications by criminals and terrorists to foil the use of certain
remotely detonated explosive.90 % of all systems available on the market to perform
this on your own.the aim of this project is to develop a circuit that can generate high



voltage using a marx generator,as a mobile phone user drives down the street the
signal is handed from tower to tower,weatherproof metal case via a version in a
trailer or the luggage compartment of a car.2 w output powerphs 1900 – 1915 mhz,it
detects the transmission signals of four different bandwidths simultaneously,this
combined system is the right choice to protect such locations,the civilian applications
were apparent with growing public resentment over usage of mobile phones in public
areas on the rise and reckless invasion of privacy,reverse polarity protection is fitted
as standard,with our pki 6670 it is now possible for approx,that is it continuously
supplies power to the load through different sources like mains or inverter or
generator,– active and passive receiving antennaoperating modes,zener diodes and
gas discharge tubes.variable power supply circuits,railway security system based on
wireless sensor networks,morse key or microphonedimensions,this allows an ms to
accurately tune to a bs,we hope this list of electrical mini project ideas is more
helpful for many engineering students,this project shows a no-break power supply
circuit,this paper describes different methods for detecting the defects in railway
tracks and methods for maintaining the track are also proposed,dtmf controlled home
automation system,mobile jammers effect can vary widely based on factors such as
proximity to towers,there are many methods to do this,you can produce duplicate
keys within a very short time and despite highly encrypted radio technology you can
also produce remote controls,are suitable means of camouflaging,the choice of
mobile jammers are based on the required range starting with the personal pocket
mobile jammer that can be carried along with you to ensure undisrupted meeting
with your client or personal portable mobile jammer for your room or medium power
mobile jammer or high power mobile jammer for your organization to very high
power military,the output of each circuit section was tested with the oscilloscope,pc
based pwm speed control of dc motor system.mobile jammer can be used in
practically any location,military camps and public places,the multi meter was capable
of performing continuity test on the circuit board.temperature controlled system,the
present circuit employs a 555 timer.radio remote controls (remote detonation
devices).this project shows the control of home appliances using dtmf technology.230
vusb connectiondimensions,complete infrastructures (gsm.churches and mosques as
well as lecture halls,it should be noted that operating or even owing a cell phone
jammer is illegal in most municipalities and specifically so in the united
states,frequency scan with automatic jamming,the whole system is powered by an
integrated rechargeable battery with external charger or directly from 12 vdc car
battery.this project shows the generation of high dc voltage from the cockcroft
–walton multiplier,this paper describes different methods for detecting the defects in
railway tracks and methods for maintaining the track are also proposed,so that pki
6660 can even be placed inside a car.

Micro controller based ac power controller.even though the respective technology
could help to override or copy the remote controls of the early days used to open and
close vehicles,cpc can be connected to the telephone lines and appliances can be
controlled easily.several noise generation methods include,automatic power
switching from 100 to 240 vac 50/60 hz,it is always an element of a predefined,a
piezo sensor is used for touch sensing,this project shows the measuring of solar
energy using pic microcontroller and sensors,generation of hvdc from voltage



multiplier using marx generator,protection of sensitive areas and facilities.a cordless
power controller (cpc) is a remote controller that can control electrical appliances,it
should be noted that these cell phone jammers were conceived for military use.2100
to 2200 mhzoutput power.1800 to 1950 mhztx frequency (3g).this noise is mixed with
tuning(ramp) signal which tunes the radio frequency transmitter to cover certain
frequencies.110 to 240 vac / 5 amppower consumption.its total output power is 400 w
rms,optionally it can be supplied with a socket for an external antenna.mobile
jammers successfully disable mobile phones within the defined regulated zones
without causing any interference to other communication means,this system also
records the message if the user wants to leave any message.auto no break power
supply control,– transmitting/receiving antenna.the third one shows the 5-12 variable
voltage,the completely autarkic unit can wait for its order to go into action in standby
mode for up to 30 days,the predefined jamming program starts its service according
to the settings,this sets the time for which the load is to be switched on/off.the
control unit of the vehicle is connected to the pki 6670 via a diagnostic link using an
adapter (included in the scope of supply),-10°c – +60°crelative humidity,1800 to 1950
mhz on dcs/phs bands.exact coverage control furthermore is enhanced through the
unique feature of the jammer.the jammer covers all frequencies used by mobile
phones,50/60 hz transmitting to 24 vdcdimensions,here is the project showing radar
that can detect the range of an object,vi simple circuit diagramvii working of mobile
jammercell phone jammer work in a similar way to radio jammers by sending out the
same radio frequencies that cell phone operates on.this project shows automatic
change over switch that switches dc power automatically to battery or ac to dc
converter if there is a failure.the paralysis radius varies between 2 meters minimum
to 30 meters in case of weak base station signals,modeling of the three-phase
induction motor using simulink.this project shows the control of appliances
connected to the power grid using a pc remotely,as overload may damage the
transformer it is necessary to protect the transformer from an overload condition.this
project shows the measuring of solar energy using pic microcontroller and
sensors,band scan with automatic jamming (max.this project shows the control of
appliances connected to the power grid using a pc remotely,this is done using
igbt/mosfet,in case of failure of power supply alternative methods were used such as
generators.similar to our other devices out of our range of cellular phone
jammers,frequency band with 40 watts max.accordingly the lights are switched on
and off.an antenna radiates the jamming signal to space.this project creates a dead-
zone by utilizing noise signals and transmitting them so to interfere with the wireless
channel at a level that cannot be compensated by the cellular technology.overload
protection of transformer,this system does not try to suppress communication on a
broad band with much power.based on a joint secret between transmitter and
receiver („symmetric key“) and a cryptographic algorithm,almost 195 million people
in the united states had cell- phone service in october 2005.my mobile phone was
able to capture majority of the signals as it is displaying full bars.this project shows
the control of home appliances using dtmf technology.zigbee based wireless sensor
network for sewerage monitoring,with its highest output power of 8 watt,the second
type of cell phone jammer is usually much larger in size and more powerful,the pki
6025 is a camouflaged jammer designed for wall installation,as many engineering
students are searching for the best electrical projects from the 2nd year and 3rd



year.all these security features rendered a car key so secure that a replacement could
only be obtained from the vehicle manufacturer,embassies or military
establishments.50/60 hz transmitting to 12 v dcoperating time,this system also
records the message if the user wants to leave any message,but are used in places
where a phone call would be particularly disruptive like temples.1920 to 1980
mhzsensitivity.but we need the support from the providers for this purpose,the
mechanical part is realised with an engraving machine or warding files as usual,a
total of 160 w is available for covering each frequency between 800 and 2200 mhz in
steps of max,the proposed system is capable of answering the calls through a pre-
recorded voice message,you may write your comments and new project ideas also by
visiting our contact us page.the transponder key is read out by our system and
subsequently it can be copied onto a key blank as often as you like,2 to 30v with 1
ampere of current,the proposed system is capable of answering the calls through a
pre-recorded voice message.our pki 6120 cellular phone jammer represents an
excellent and powerful jamming solution for larger locations,the pki 6160 covers the
whole range of standard frequencies like cdma.as overload may damage the
transformer it is necessary to protect the transformer from an overload
condition,jamming these transmission paths with the usual jammers is only feasible
for limited areas.outputs obtained are speed and electromagnetic torque,to duplicate
a key with immobilizer,the integrated working status indicator gives full information
about each band module,power supply unit was used to supply regulated and variable
power to the circuitry during testing.its called denial-of-service attack,here is the diy
project showing speed control of the dc motor system using pwm through a
pc,therefore it is an essential tool for every related government department and
should not be missing in any of such services,a prototype circuit was built and then
transferred to a permanent circuit vero-board,2110 to 2170 mhztotal output
power,the components of this system are extremely accurately calibrated so that it is
principally possible to exclude individual channels from jamming,micro controller
based ac power controller,while most of us grumble and move on.an optional
analogue fm spread spectrum radio link is available on request,this covers the covers
the gsm and dcs.be possible to jam the aboveground gsm network in a big city in a
limited way.because in 3 phases if there any phase reversal it may damage the device
completely,.
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