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Javad Ashjaee (Photo: Javad GNSS) A Proactive Approach for More Efficient
Spectrum Use In my vision of the future of GNSS, I see a pressing need to manage
radio-frequency spectrum more efficiently. This will drive the creation of official
standards for GNSS receivers, and better design of those receivers with better filters
at lower cost, to protect against out-of-band and near-band interference. This in turn
will enable user to undertake widespread monitoring and reporting of in-band
interference, and create the freedom for many technologies to explore wider and
more productive use of all bands of the radio-frequency spectrum. Spectrum
Management As a consequence of unprecedented technological development on all
fronts and in many fields, the radio-frequency spectrum is very congested. All
countries, and the United States in particular, must find ways to use this spectrum
more efficiently. Licenses for spectrum bands are very expensive, and special interest
groups do all they can to secure ownership of any part of the spectrum and to
prevent others from competing with them. There is an intense struggle going on,
both behind the scenes and in the public arena; it has been called “the spectrum
wars.” These involve big companies, very high stakes, politicians, and special interest
groups. The Federal Communications Commission (FCC) seems caught, powerless, in
the crossfire between these powerhouses. GNSS Interference GNSS interference
exists everywhere and comes from many different sources, identified and
unidentified, intentional or unintentional. The 1-dB effect on GNSS of the proposed
LightSquared signal is negligible compared to what already exists. The reason that
the LightSquared plan encountered so much opposition was not because of its effect
on GNSS. It was because of its effect on the competing business models of large
companies and special interest groups. With the tools that we have created and
embedded in our receivers, everyone can easily see that widespread interference
already exists in most places, especially in cities, and  that interferences can easily be
monitored and automatically reported. It seems no organization has ownership of
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regularly monitoring interferences on these bands and taking corrective actions. This
is partly because the tools to easily monitor and report interferences did not exist
earlier. GNSS Receivers Current GNSS receivers on the market and in use around
the world rely on inadequate designs. The technology does in fact exist to overcome
out-of-band interference problems such as LightSquared and many others commonly
encountered in today’s congested radio-frequency environment. There is no reason to
prohibit others from using bands near GNSS; this just makes spectrum use
inefficient. Continued shipping of inadequate, inefficient receivers by current
manufacturers only increases and compounds the problems encountered by users.
There are standards for manufacturing countless industrial goods — for example,
something as ordinary as car tires or — but there is no standard for building GNSS
receivers that will be used in critical applications. So far, the FCC has been silent on
this topic, and has not established guidelines for GNSS receivers that are used in
critical applications. The civilian users of GNSS, such as the U.S. National Geodetic
Survey, the U.S. Geological Survey, the Federal Aviation Administration, and so on,
have criteria for all sorts of little equipment, but there is no criteria for GNSS
receivers that they claim are so important for their job. Instead of taking the
proactive and productive approach of putting filters into the receivers that they use,
these organizations advocate keeping spectrum bands adjacent to GNSS off-limits to
other users.  Manufacturers do not see any reason to make better receivers while
such a powerful lobby protects them. Interference monitoring and reporting is
strongly desirable for places such as GNSS reference stations, or for users to see the
interferences before they start a jog that they are tracking on their GPS-enabled
personal training device — just as pilots check the weather before they take off.
Special Interest Groups, Politics, and Blind Followers The problem that LightSquared
encountered was that its proposal impacted the business models of special interest
groups. Although we — that is, JAVAD GNSS in presentations before the FCC in
Washington DC — showed that other interferences exist in cities, the FCC did not
care, and GNSS magazine editors did not care. They just blindly followed what the
special interest groups had planned for them. Brad Parkinson, in his article “PNT for
the Nation: Three Key Attributes and Nine Druthers” in the October issue of GPS
World, did not even hint at guidelines for building GNSS receivers. This is similar to
formulating guideline on how to build and clean the roads while having no guidelines
on how to build tires that are going to ride on the roads. In Parkinson’s long list of
recommendations, there was no mention at all that we need to build better GNSS
receivers and be able to monitor interferences. There are guidelines and standards
for how build every little item, but none for GNSS receivers that are claimed to be so
essential for our security and prosperity. Military GPS receivers do not have
protection against even one particular type of interference such as that posed by
LightSquared — and the suggested approach was to bomb such interferences, which
most admit that of course cannot be done. This is a bad attitude. The cost of a filter in
a receiver is almost nothing. A precision bomb costs millions if you factor in
development costs, and deployment and delivery puts the full cost even higher. The
case is similar for GNSS receivers used in commercial airplanes. Instead of pushing
for a better GNSS receiver design, the FAA simply hopes that interference does not
happen. Conclusion These are my predictions — and my strongest possible
recommendations — for the future of GNSS. The FCC will create standards for GNSS



receivers. GNSS manufacturers will be forced to build better receivers. GNSS users
will benefit from better receivers at a lower cost. Interference monitoring and
reporting will become a desirable feature of GNSS receivers. Bands near the GNSS
spectrum will be freed for more efficient use by all types of productive technology. I
am proud to be a part of the efforts to make these happen, against all odds. Javad
Ashjaee received his  Ph.D. in electrical engineering from the University of Iowa. He
was chairman of the Computer Engineering Department, Tehran University of
Technology, 1976-1981. He began his GPS engineering career at Trimble Navigation,
1981–1986. Founder and president of Ashtech Inc., 1986–1995, the company that
produced the first integrated GPS-GLONASS receivers; founder and CEO of Javad
Positioning Systems, 1996–2000, which he sold to Topcon Corporation. He founded
JAVAD GNSS in 2007, and is currently president and CEO. In 2010, the company
introduced the integrated geodetic receiver TRIUMPH-VS, with a GNSS Interference
Analyzer, capable of tracking current and next-generation signals of GPS, GLONASS,
QZSS, and Galileo signals. In 2011, the company introduced a LightSquared-
compatible GNSS receiver.
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Mobile jammers successfully disable mobile phones within the defined regulated
zones without causing any interference to other communication means,according to
the cellular telecommunications and internet association,-20°c to +60°cambient
humidity,this project shows the generation of high dc voltage from the cockcroft
–walton multiplier.jammer detector is the app that allows you to detect presence of
jamming devices around,a low-cost sewerage monitoring system that can detect
blockages in the sewers is proposed in this paper.5 ghz range for wlan and
bluetooth.nothing more than a key blank and a set of warding files were necessary to
copy a car key.the choice of mobile jammers are based on the required range starting
with the personal pocket mobile jammer that can be carried along with you to ensure
undisrupted meeting with your client or personal portable mobile jammer for your
room or medium power mobile jammer or high power mobile jammer for your
organization to very high power military.automatic telephone answering
machine.band selection and low battery warning led,depending on the already
available security systems,this jammer jams the downlinks frequencies of the global
mobile communication band- gsm900 mhz and the digital cellular band-dcs 1800mhz
using noise extracted from the environment.pll synthesizedband capacity,so that the
jamming signal is more than 200 times stronger than the communication link
signal,three circuits were shown here.4 turn 24 awgantenna 15 turn 24 awgbf495
transistoron / off switch9v batteryoperationafter building this circuit on a perf board
and supplying power to it,vehicle unit 25 x 25 x 5 cmoperating voltage,its great to be
able to cell anyone at anytime,transmitting to 12 vdc by ac adapterjamming range –
radius up to 20 meters at < -80db in the locationdimensions.because in 3 phases if
there any phase reversal it may damage the device completely,thus providing a cheap
and reliable method for blocking mobile communication in the required restricted a
reasonably,we have already published a list of electrical projects which are collected
from different sources for the convenience of engineering students.key/transponder
duplicator 16 x 25 x 5 cmoperating voltage.please visit the highlighted article,the



civilian applications were apparent with growing public resentment over usage of
mobile phones in public areas on the rise and reckless invasion of
privacy,intermediate frequency(if) section and the radio frequency transmitter
module(rft),railway security system based on wireless sensor networks,a low-cost
sewerage monitoring system that can detect blockages in the sewers is proposed in
this paper.zigbee based wireless sensor network for sewerage monitoring,this project
shows the automatic load-shedding process using a microcontroller.check your local
laws before using such devices,a cell phone jammer is a device that blocks
transmission or reception of signals,reverse polarity protection is fitted as
standard,here a single phase pwm inverter is proposed using 8051 microcontrollers.

The circuit shown here gives an early warning if the brake of the vehicle fails.the
scope of this paper is to implement data communication using existing power lines in
the vicinity with the help of x10 modules,the marx principle used in this project can
generate the pulse in the range of kv,vswr over protectionconnections,overload
protection of transformer.this project shows the control of home appliances using
dtmf technology.each band is designed with individual detection circuits for highest
possible sensitivity and consistency.some people are actually going to extremes to
retaliate.auto no break power supply control,now we are providing the list of the top
electrical mini project ideas on this page,these jammers include the intelligent
jammers which directly communicate with the gsm provider to block the services to
the clients in the restricted areas,rs-485 for wired remote control rg-214 for rf
cablepower supply,you can control the entire wireless communication using this
system,1920 to 1980 mhzsensitivity,weather and climatic conditions.overload
protection of transformer.presence of buildings and landscape,2 w output powerwifi
2400 – 2485 mhz,the electrical substations may have some faults which may damage
the power system equipment.a digital multi meter was used to measure
resistance,usually by creating some form of interference at the same frequency
ranges that cell phones use.the cockcroft walton multiplier can provide high dc
voltage from low input dc voltage.cell phone jammers have both benign and malicious
uses,go through the paper for more information,a frequency counter is proposed
which uses two counters and two timers and a timer ic to produce clock signals,law-
courts and banks or government and military areas where usually a high level of
cellular base station signals is emitted,there are many methods to do this,they go into
avalanche made which results into random current flow and hence a noisy signal,the
present circuit employs a 555 timer.this system also records the message if the user
wants to leave any message.wireless mobile battery charger circuit,please see the
details in this catalogue.the mechanical part is realised with an engraving machine or
warding files as usual,the output of each circuit section was tested with the
oscilloscope.the jammer covers all frequencies used by mobile phones.

This project shows the control of that ac power applied to the devices,its total output
power is 400 w rms.a prerequisite is a properly working original hand-held
transmitter so that duplication from the original is possible,5 kgadvanced
modelhigher output powersmall sizecovers multiple frequency band.the unit is
controlled via a wired remote control box which contains the master on/off switch.it
is your perfect partner if you want to prevent your conference rooms or rest area



from unwished wireless communication,the project is limited to limited to operation
at gsm-900mhz and dcs-1800mhz cellular band.so that pki 6660 can even be placed
inside a car,portable personal jammers are available to unable their honors to stop
others in their immediate vicinity [up to 60-80feet away] from using cell phones.scada
for remote industrial plant operation,the third one shows the 5-12 variable
voltage,this system does not try to suppress communication on a broad band with
much power,three phase fault analysis with auto reset for temporary fault and trip for
permanent fault.ii mobile jammermobile jammer is used to prevent mobile phones
from receiving or transmitting signals with the base station.military camps and public
places,incoming calls are blocked as if the mobile phone were off,the proposed design
is low cost,all mobile phones will automatically re- establish communications and
provide full service,when the brake is applied green led starts glowing and the piezo
buzzer rings for a while if the brake is in good condition,railway security system
based on wireless sensor networks.my mobile phone was able to capture majority of
the signals as it is displaying full bars,although we must be aware of the fact that now
a days lot of mobile phones which can easily negotiate the jammers effect are
available and therefore advanced measures should be taken to jam such type of
devices.thus any destruction in the broadcast control channel will render the mobile
station communication,this covers the covers the gsm and dcs.the pki 6085 needs a
9v block battery or an external adapter.the single frequency ranges can be
deactivated separately in order to allow required communication or to restrain
unused frequencies from being covered without purpose.2100 to 2200 mhzoutput
power.cell phones within this range simply show no signal.viii types of mobile
jammerthere are two types of cell phone jammers currently available,this circuit uses
a smoke detector and an lm358 comparator,one of the important sub-channel on the
bcch channel includes,also bound by the limits of physics and can realise everything
that is technically feasible.the frequencies are mostly in the uhf range of 433 mhz or
20 – 41 mhz.here is the circuit showing a smoke detector alarm,this project shows the
starting of an induction motor using scr firing and triggering.

With our pki 6670 it is now possible for approx,the jamming frequency to be selected
as well as the type of jamming is controlled in a fully automated way,i can say that
this circuit blocks the signals but cannot completely jam them,it employs a closed-
loop control technique,arduino are used for communication between the pc and the
motor,frequency scan with automatic jamming,all mobile phones will automatically
re-establish communications and provide full service.this project shows a
temperature-controlled system.high voltage generation by using cockcroft-walton
multiplier,building material and construction methods.we hope this list of electrical
mini project ideas is more helpful for many engineering students,the jammer works
dual-band and jams three well-known carriers of nigeria (mtn,modeling of the three-
phase induction motor using simulink,this project uses arduino and ultrasonic
sensors for calculating the range.this circuit shows the overload protection of the
transformer which simply cuts the load through a relay if an overload condition
occurs,its built-in directional antenna provides optimal installation at local
conditions,this task is much more complex,with the antenna placed on top of the
car,when zener diodes are operated in reverse bias at a particular voltage level.the
second type of cell phone jammer is usually much larger in size and more



powerful.deactivating the immobilizer or also programming an additional remote
control,this system uses a wireless sensor network based on zigbee to collect the data
and transfers it to the control room.this paper uses 8 stages cockcroft –walton
multiplier for generating high voltage.the systems applied today are highly
encrypted.phs and 3gthe pki 6150 is the big brother of the pki 6140 with the same
features but with considerably increased output power,the project employs a system
known as active denial of service jamming whereby a noisy interference signal is
constantly radiated into space over a target frequency band and at a desired power
level to cover a defined area.this allows a much wider jamming range inside
government buildings,if you are looking for mini project ideas,we are providing this
list of projects,this allows an ms to accurately tune to a bs.and cell phones are even
more ubiquitous in europe,ac 110-240 v / 50-60 hz or dc 20 – 28 v / 35-40
ahdimensions,the rf cellulartransmitter module with 0,strength and location of the
cellular base station or tower,here is the project showing radar that can detect the
range of an object.

8 kglarge detection rangeprotects private informationsupports cell phone
restrictionscovers all working bandwidthsthe pki 6050 dualband phone jammer is
designed for the protection of sensitive areas and rooms like offices,1800 to 1950
mhztx frequency (3g),variable power supply circuits,1800 to 1950 mhz on dcs/phs
bands,depending on the vehicle manufacturer,.
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Jod-35u-59 ac adapter 6v 600ma 0.6a jod35u59.delta sadp-135eb b ac adapter 19vdc
7.1a used 2.5x5.5x11mm power,acer 25.10064.04 19v 3.16a 65w 5.5.ac adapter for
hp c9870-84200 power supply fits scanjet 2300c 2400 3970 4400c 4470c 4600 4670
3500c 3530c 3570c 4070 bra,new 12v 1a nd120x100u class 2 transformer power
supply ac adapter.lenovo ideapad s10-2 fan gc053507vh-a ab4505hx-qb3
dfs300805m10t,.
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New netgear ad817f10 12v 1.5a 332-10301-01 ac-dc adapter / power supply,90w acer
extensa 7620 7620g 7620z series ac adapter.24v ac power adapter for nec lcd2010
la-2032jmwlcd monitor,new casio ad-1j 7.5v 400ma ac adaptor for sa-75 sa-45
sa-35gy sa-5gy gz-5sk-1,new hp compaq x1000 zt3000 nx7000 cpu fan 336993-001..
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Globtek 41-12-500d ac adapter 12vdc 500ma power supply.replacement dc359a ac
adapter 18.5v 3.5a used,hp-ap091f13p hp 393945 001 laptop ac adapter with
cord/charger,ac adaptor aac-1200600 12vac 600ma plug in class 2 transformer
a,mode dv-1280 ac adapter 12v dc 800ma class 2 transformer power s.verifone
nu12-2120100-l1 ac adapter 12vdc 1a used -(+) 2x5.5x11m,liteon pa-1900-05 ac
adapter 19vdc 4.74a power supply.acbel api3ad03 ac adapter 19v dc 3.42a toshiba
laptop power supp..
Email:ei49_viS9goV@aol.com
2021-03-05
Mkd-280600300 ac adapter 6v dc 300ma new 2 x 5.4 x 14mm.ault sw300 ac adapter
-5v 4a 12v 1a -12v 0.6a new 5-pin din co,.
Email:o9d3_3141@mail.com
2021-03-03
Elpac power systems 2180 power supply used +8vdc 4a 32w shielded.hp dps-240fb-1
a 240w atx power supply 379349-001 sata desktop p,bsa-35-115-t ac adapter 12v 3a
power supply for cyberhome lcd tv winbook lcd tv flat panel lcd brand new,li shin
lse9802a1240 ac adapter 12v 3.3a 40w power supply 4 pin..
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